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On the basis of Regulation No. 2001/19 on the Executive branch of the provisional 
institutions of self-Government in Kosovo as amended by Regulation 2002/5 and 
Regulation 2005/15.  
 
Pursuant to Article 22.2 of Law on Electricity No. 2004/10, promulgated by UNMIK 
Regulation No.2004/22 of 30 June 2004, 
 
Taking into account the discontinuity in the development of the electricity consumption 
at major final consumers during last few years does not allow the determining eligible 
customers strictly on the base of the yearly electricity consumption in previous year and 
on the proportion of energy costs to the price of their products and services, as well as 
 
The importance of the electricity consumption for the development of the business of 
main industrial enterprises and also the potential increase of demand for electricity 
related to the business of the final customer is linked with the voltage level of the 
network to which the customer is directly connected 
 
The Minister of Energy and Mining, hereby issues: 
 

Administrative Instruction No 001/2006 
 

 
Implementing Law on Electricity No.2004/10, on the conditions for 

Determining eligible customers for the year 2006 
 
 

Article 1 
This Instruction sets forth condition for determining eligible costumers for the year 2006. 
 

Article 2 
 

The terms used in this Implementing Instruction shall have the meaning stipulated in the 
law on Energy No.2004/8, the law on the Energy Regulator No.2004/9 and the Law on 
Electricity No.2004/10, 
 



Article 3 
 

3.1. The following conditions are set for determining eligible costumers for the year 
2006: 
 
a) Final customers connected directly to the transmission network of high-voltage level at 
110 kV and above, and 
 
b) Metering devices and the corresponding control and communication devices 
corresponds with condition determined in the Article 33.2 of the Law on Electricity. 
 
3.2. A customer may maintain its eligible customer status so long as none of the 
following conditions occur. Should any one of them occur it will result in the immediate 
revocation of eligible customer status. Eligible status shall be revoked if: 

a) KEK’s business is negatively affected causing it to fail in its obligations to other 
customers (Public Service Obligations); 

b) Any unreasonable constraints are imposed on the current and planned structure of 
the industry, KEK or the wholesale or retail electricity markets; 

c) There are present any cross-subsidization of prices between the eligible and 
regulated customer sectors; or 

d) KEK suffers aggregate, incremental losses over any rolling twelve month period, 
which losses impose a direct or indirect requirement for a subsidy from the KCB. 

 
Article 4 

 
This Instruction enters into force the day of its signature. 
 
 
 
 
Prishtinë, ________                                                             Minister of Energy and Mining 
                Ethem Çeku 


